AerSale
I

AerSale ® Inc.

Parts Distribution

255 Alhambra Circle, Suite 435

Coral Gables, FL 33134 United States
Phone: 305.764.3200 Fax: 305.529.6686
TIN: 26-3065158

www.AerSale.com

QUOTATION

For : Account No. [85281700810]

Henixio Aviation
Room 218-9, 2/Floor, Block B,

Proficient Industrial Centre,6 Wang Kwun Road,

Kowloon Bay
Hong Kong
Tel. : +85281700810

In response to your request, we are pleased to quote you the following: FCA
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No. 29543300
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Our Ref
Your Ref
Terms

Our Contact
eMail

Valid Until

Quote Date

: Q29543300

: RFQ-4286E65

:PREPAID

: Syafigah Agilah

: Syafigah.Aqgilah@aersale.com
: Dec-09-2023

: ORIGIN

: Nov-09-2023

Line P/N & Description

Cnd Qty Bid Delivery

Unit Price Amount

01 1475M35P01

BLADE

Rev: A

Serial No(s).: 233R0
LAST OP: TBA
EN/AC SN: TBA
MODEL#: CFM56

RC-A: 0

CERT DATE:Jun-15-2001
MFG: CFM International Inc.
02 1475M29P03

LLP-HPT STAGE 1 DISK
Rev: A

MFG: CFM International Inc.
03 1385M90P04

LLP-HPT FRONT SHAFT
Rev: A

MFG: CFM International Inc.
04 1475M29P02

LLP-HPT STAGE 1 DISK
Rev: A

MFG: CFM International Inc.
06 2080M29G01

NOZZLE SEGMENT HPT STATOR
MFG: CFM International Inc.

CERT INFO: GE AVIATION SERVICES

OH 1 EA Stock

OH NO BID

OH NO BID

OH NO BID

OH NO BID

$1,750.00 EA $1,750.00

This quote (or order) shall be governed by and subject to the applicable signed agreement with Customer, or, if no applicable
signed agreement exists, the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.

Any different or additional terms set forth by Customer are rejected in advance and are of no effect. As such, the Company’s
fulfillment of this quote (or order) does not constitute acceptance of any such different or additional terms, and such terms do
not serve to modify or amend this quote (or order), any applicable signed agreement,

or the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.

Continued on next page...

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.

Terms & Conditions - https://info.aersale.com/hubfs/AerSale_TC.pdf
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Line P/N & Description Cnd

Qty Bid

Delivery

Unit Price Amount

05 305-350-159-0 OH
NOZZLE SEGMENT LPT STAGE 1
Rev: A

MFG: SNECMA
07 305-350-059-0 OH

NOZZLE SEGMENT LPT STAGE 1
Rev: A

MFG: SNECMA
08 305-390-311-0 OH

NOZZLE
Rev: A

Serial No(s).: DA263379-K

LAST OP: OLYMPIC AIRLINES

EN/AC SN: 727262

MODEL#: B737-400

09 305-390-518-0 OH

NOZZLE
Rev: A

Serial No(s).: J8AS620

LAST OP: Medview

EN/AC SN: 726313

MODEL#: CFM56-3

10 551201 OH

BLADE HPT 1 STG
Serial No(s).: CKLBGA5033

LAST OP: Air Atlanta Icelandi

EN/AC SN: P727321

MODEL#: PW4056

CERT INFO: Chromalloy

CERT DATE:Dec-12-2022

MFG: United Technologies Corp. Pratt & Whitney Spare Parts Div

NO BID

NO BID

35 Days

35 Days

Stock

By accepting this quotation and/or an agreement to purchase from AerSale, Inc., the buyer also confirms that the buyer
has knowledge of, understands, and will abide by all U.S. Export Control laws governing this product, including

$850.00 EA $1,700.00

$1,000.00 EA

$2,000.00

$19,000.00 EA $ 19,000.00

not serve to modify or amend this quote (or order), any applicable signed agreement,
or the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.

This quote (or order) shall be governed by and subject to the applicable signed agreement with Customer, or, if no applicable
signed agreement exists, the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.

Any different or additional terms set forth by Customer are rejected in advance and are of no effect. As such, the Company’s
fulfillment of this quote (or order) does not constitute acceptance of any such different or additional terms, and such terms do

Continued on next page...

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.

Terms & Conditions - https://info.aersale.com/hubfs/AerSale_TC.pdf
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but not limited to the following:
EXPORT CONTROL NOTICE
United States law prohibits the export or re-export of these commodities to North Korea, Iran, Cuba, Syria or Sudan
unless otherwise authorized by the United States Government. The sale and/or export to other destinations or parties’
wherever located may also be prohibited. You must adhere to all U.S. Export Regulations that govern these commodities.
AerSale assumes no responsibility for your failure to obtain any necessary export approvals in accordance with
U.S. Export Regulations.
#e ATTENTION PURCHASER - CERTAIN UNITS REQUIRES AN EXPORT LICENSE FROM THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE PRIOR TO EXPORT FROM U.S.A., AERSALE, INC. ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY
FOR YOUR FAILURE TO OBTAIN LICENSE PRIOR TO EXPORT#****
Export classification is subject to change without notice. AerSale makes no representation as to the accuracy or reliability
of the information. Any use of this classification information is without recourse to AerSale and is at your own risk.
> Returned items are subject to a 25% restocking fee and all shipping charges.
> No returns or refunds after 30 days.
> All returned items must be accompanied by an RMA number.
> AerSale, Inc. does not pay shipping fees or charges for retuned items
> Warranties form Repair Stations are extended to our customers. All other warranties must be agreed to in writing
and notated on the purchase/sales order.
] ] Sub Total: $ 24 450.00
This quote (or order) shall be governed by and subject to the applicable signed agreement with Customer, or, if no applicable
signed agreement exists, the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.
Any different or additional terms set forth by Customer are rejected in advance and are of no effect. As such, the Company's
fulfillment of this quote (or order) does not constitute acceptance of any such different or additional terms, and such terms do
not serve to modify or amend this quote (or order), any applicable signed agreement,
or the standard terms and conditions at https://www.aersale.com/termsandconditions.
Total:  [USD] $ 24.450.00

Syafigah Agilah, Account Manager

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc. Terms & Conditions - https://info.aersale.com/hubfs/AerSale TC.pdf




